F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-1202
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM 5 S 3
P. O. BOX 2449 o £ g . o &
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 o 3 g g § g § < 2 0 S RN ﬁ o~ P
TABULATION OF BIDS g g nR o= = g 8 % R 393 = § ?5: 050' -go 2
o O =g QL c 5 (<] X ‘B X 5 o = - o X
prorosaL  Annual Contract for Dell Printer Ink Toners, Cartridges s 2 s L£O I S s 8 S =3 = o - & o < s 8 E § =
i o =z 3 > c - £EHh - Sowo 2 & (SRR S @ v o O
FOR: and Other Supplies g N g S &3 o S E 22 s Sag s == IS = oug S Bz
TIVE & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019) £ 3 3 28%S 258 £E&3 s g w2 g 33 < ui € = 3L
; i oo = S22 £ 3 0 <C > Ewnd<g = =@ SN § oMOg
DATE: 3:00 p.m.,AprII 24, 2018 2 G 2 @ -8 |': é o) 8 = o S o c S,' N = 8% = 2 G E g% = g S =
72} ) -
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY _IE D. S 8 E g U_) E 8 6 S 2 L% 8 ?\rl (7) % > :r' 8 IE D. § & :‘-! 8 ; D. %
Base Year: June 1, 2018 - May 31, 2019
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1130 BLACK PRICE 75.99 55.00 76.00 84.00 80.74 89.59 88.80 94.29
1. Part No. 7H53W / Lawson No. 37497 TOTAL 1,139.85 825.00 1,140.00 1,260.00 1,211.10 1,343.85 1,332.00 1,414.35
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C BLACK PRICE 10.00 48.33 54.00 48.00 57.79 56.95 63.75 67.49
2. Part No. NO12K / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 20.00 96.66 108.00 96.00 115.58 113.90 127.50 134.98
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C CYAN PRICE 10.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 49.95 56.20 59.54
3. Part No. JO69K / Lawson No. 37499 TOTAL 20.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 99.90 112.40 119.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C IMAGING DRUM PRICE 80.00 79.99 88.00 103.00 93.49 109.95 102.90 109.18
4, Part No. K110K / Lawson No. 37502 TOTAL 160.00 159.98 176.00 206.00 186.98 219.90 205.80 218.36
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 49.95 56.20 59.54
5. Part No. J506K / Lawson No. 37500 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 99.90 112.40 119.08
2 ea/ UNIT
DELL 1230C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 42.88 45.00 48.00 50.99 49.95 56.20 59.54 B W
6. Part No. M1276 / Lawson No. 37501 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 90.00 96.00 101.98 99.90 112.40 119.08 S
< =
40 ea. UNIT _| <£
DELL 1320C BLACK PRICE 59.24 48.33 63.00 70.00 67.14 69.95 73.95 78.40 a e}
7. Part No. KU052 / Lawson No. 37503 TOTAL 2,369.60 1,933.20 2,520.00 2,800.00 2,685.60 2,798.00 2,958.00 3,136.00 fj %
10 ea. UNIT - @
DELL 1320C CYAN PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 89.95 94.45 100.24 % pr
8. Part No. KU053 / Lawson No. 37504 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 899.50 944,50 1,002.40 ) %
10 ea. UNIT m
DELL 1320C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 89.95 94.45 100.24
9. Part No. KUO55 / Lawson No. 37505 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 899.50 944,50 1,002.40
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 89.95 94.45 100.24
10. Part No. KU054 / Lawson No. 37506 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 899.50 944.50 1,002.40
25 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW BLACK PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 66.95 64.85 69.47
11. Part No. 3K9XM / Lawson No. 37507 TOTAL 1,487.25 1,347.00 1,400.00 1,625.00 1,487.25 1,673.75 1,621.25 1,736.75
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW CYAN PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47
12. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 37508 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,004.25 986.25 1,042.05
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47
13. Part No. 56DTC / Lawson No. 37509 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,004.25 986.25 1,042.05
20 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47
14. Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 37510 TOTAL 1,189.80 1,077.60 1,120.00 1,300.00 1,189.80 1,339.00 1,315.00 1,389.40
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1700N BLACK PRICE 80.00 81.33 150.00 105.00 85.84 126.95 168.60 126.46
15. Part No. Y5009 / Lawson No. 37551 TOTAL 160.00 162.66 300.00 210.00 171.68 253.90 337.20 252.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1700N IMAGING DRUM PRICE 30.00 36.33 30.00 59.00 50.14 56.95 55.30 58.56
16. Part No. W5390 / Lawson No. 37552 TOTAL 60.00 72.66 60.00 118.00 100.28 113.90 110.60 117.12
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 BLACK PRICE 90.00 88.33 158.00 105.00 168.29 129.95 131.20 136.97
17. Part No. PY449 / Lawson No. 37511 TOTAL 180.00 176.66 316.00 210.00 336.58 259.90 262.40 273.94
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 IMAGING DRUM PRICE 20.00 36.33 46.00 59.00 49.29 39.95 54.45 57.56
18. Part No. MW685 / Lawson No. 37512 TOTAL 40.00 72.66 92.00 118.00 98.58 79.90 108.90 115.12
5 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW BLACK PRICE 55.99 53.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 66.95 64.85 69.47
19. Part No. DCONW / Lawson No. 40012 TOTAL 279.95 269.40 280.00 320.00 297.45 334.75 324.25 347.35
4 ea. UNIT a)
DELL 1760NW CYAN PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47 |"'—J g
20. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 40015 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 267.80 263.00 277.88 i )
4 ea. UNIT 28
DELL 1760NW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47 |<£ %
21. Part No. 4DV2W / Lawson No. 40014 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 267.80 263.00 277.88 E
4 ea. UNIT o
DELL 1760NW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 66.95 65.75 69.47 a cz)
22. Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 40013 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 267.80 263.00 277.88 o
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN BLACK PRICE 82.39 76.33 82.00 85.00 87.54 96.95 96.25 102.22
23. Part No. MY5TJ / Lawson No. 37513 TOTAL 1,235.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,275.00 1,313.10 1,454.25 1,443.75 1,533.30
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN CYAN PRICE 81.59 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 96.95 95.40 101.23
24. Part No. THKJ8 / Lawson No. 37514 TOTAL 1,223.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,454.25 1,431.00 1,518.45
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 79.99 98.88 80.00 92.00 84.99 99.95 93.50 99.24
25. Part No. WDH78 / Lawson No. 37517 TOTAL 159.98 197.76 160.00 184.00 169.98 199.90 187.00 198.48
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN MAGENTA PRICE 79.99 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 96.95 95.40 101.23
26. Part No. 2Y3CM / Lawson No. 37515 TOTAL 1,199.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,454.25 1,431.00 1,518.45
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN YELLOW PRICE 79.99 76.33 81.00 92.00 86.69 96.95 95.40 101.23
27. Part No. 9X54J / Lawson No. 37516 TOTAL 799.90 763.30 810.00 920.00 866.90 969.50 954.00 1,012.30




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-1202
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM 5 8 38
P. O. BOX 2449 o = g - © =
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - é g’ g § o g 9 g 9 § .o ﬁ N ‘g 9
TABULATION OF BIDS S E 53 * 3 g 2 Sw R N g g = £_R
= [ 5] ‘D - - = <
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Dell Printer Ink Toners, Cartridges = § ; & ZE) 5: 8 s o S % = ﬁ § 5 § ™ S’: é 2 8 = § ﬁ
p o - < > = c - EHh - © O LYo = < SR S @ . v o O
FOR: and Other Supplies QN g S 23 SE JORagy = Z°c 5 = T <= o w g T mnZ
TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019) £ 38 2833 35 S £&573 ST w2 838 o ui E =35 £
; 3:00 p.m., April 24, 2018 ooz 7322 £ 7 T oo EBJL S, o a2 55 8 o0 g
DATE p-m., Ap ' Lo X o B~ E OZ & o g ES s o Omn Q v o S >© € SO <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY _IS D. S 8 E g U_) E 8 6 3 2 L 8 ?\rl (7) % >I :r' 8 lE D. § ﬁ :‘-! 8 ; D. %
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2330DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 119.95 153.95 163.77
28. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37518 TOTAL 1,500.00 1,303.20 1,980.00 1,875.00 2,103.60 1,799.25 2,309.25 2,456.55
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 2350DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 119.95 153.95 163.77
29. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37519 TOTAL 1,000.00 868.80 1,320.00 1,250.00 1,402.40 1,199.50 1,539.50 1,637.70
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2360DN BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 184.00 160.00 195.49 162.95 158.65 168.73
30. Part No. 1V7V7 / Lawson No. 41609 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,760.00 2,400.00 2,932.35 2,444.25 2,379.75 2,530.95
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN BLACK PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 59.95 61.00 64.23
31. Part No. KH225 / Lawson No. 37520 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 119.90 122.00 128.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN CYAN PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 85.94 89.30 94.29
32. Part No. TH207 / Lawson No. 37521 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 171.88 178.60 188.58
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 4.00 201.05 160.00 99.00 170.84 99.95 187.25 199.50 A
33. Part No. M5065 / Lawson No. 37524 TOTAL 8.00 402.10 320.00 198.00 341.68 199.90 374.50 399.00 W
2 ea. UNIT 5 %
DELL 3010CN MAGENTA PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 85.95 89.30 94.29 -] %
34. Part No. TH209 / Lawson No. 37522 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 171.90 178.60 188.58 2 5
2ea. UNIT |': W
DELL 3010CN YELLOW PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 85.95 89.30 94.29 CZD =
35. Part No. TH208 / Lawson No. 37523 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 171.90 178.60 188.58 a %
2 ea. UNIT m
DELL 3110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 216.33 184.00 221.00 194.65 219.95 218.70 227.30
36. Part No. XG715 / Lawson No. 37529 TOTAL 100.00 432.66 368.00 442.00 389.30 439.90 437.40 454.60
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 116.00 139.00 130.89 139.95 146.40 152.84
37. Part No. XG721 / Lawson No. 37525 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 232.00 278.00 261.78 279.90 292.80 305.68
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN CYAN PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 129.95 134.40 142.92
38. Part No. XG726 / Lawson No. 37526 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244.78 259.90 268.80 285.84
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN MAGENTA PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 129.95 134.40 142.92
39. Part No. XG727 / Lawson No. 37527 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244.78 259.90 268.80 285.84
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN YELLOW PRICE 115.00 98.88 116.00 135.00 122.39 129.95 134.40 142.92
40. Part No. XG728 / Lawson No. 37528 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 232.00 270.00 244.78 259.90 268.80 285.84
6 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN BLACK PRICE 118.00 106.88 112.00 120.00 118.99 129.95 130.75 138.11
41. Part No. G486F / Lawson No. 37530 TOTAL 708.00 641.28 672.00 720.00 713.94 779.70 784.50 828.66
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN CYAN PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 96.95 98.15 104.21
42, Part No. G479F / Lawson No. 37531 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 193.90 196.30 208.42
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN MAGENTA PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 96.95 98.15 104.21
43. Part No. G480F / Lawson No. 37532 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 193.90 196.30 208.42
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN YELLOW PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 96.95 98.15 104.21
44, Part No. G481F / Lawson No. 37533 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 193.90 196.30 208.42
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3330DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 143.33 127.00 158.00 135.99 149.95 149.35 158.80
45, Part No. U902R / Part No. 38741 TOTAL 238.00 286.66 254.00 316.00 271.98 299.90 298.70 317.60
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3333DN 3335DN BLACK PRICE 179.00 126.33 172.00 199.00 182.74 206.95 200.30 NO BID
46. Part No. HMHW3 / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 358.00 252.66 344.00 398.00 365.48 413.90 400.60
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN BLACK PRICE 107.99 106.88 108.00 125.00 114.74 129.95 126.00 133.99
47. Part No. 4CHT7 / Lawson No. 39913 TOTAL 215.98 213.76 216.00 250.00 229.48 259.90 252.00 267.98 8 "
2 ea. UNIT |<7: >
DELL 3760DN CYAN PRICE 153.59 143.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 189.95 179.10 190.57 51 2
48. Part No. 9FY32 / Lawson No. 39914 TOTAL 307.18 286.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 379.90 358.20 381.14 m Q
2 ea. UNIT 5 m
DELL 3760DN MAGENTA PRICE 153.59 148.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 189.95 179.10 190.57 5 o
49, Part No. H5XJP / Lawson No. 39916 TOTAL 307.18 296.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 379.90 358.20 381.14 z %
2ea. UNIT % z
DELL 3760DN YELLOW PRICE 153.59 229.45 153.00 171.00 163.19 189.95 179.10 190.57
50. Part No. RGJCW / Lawson No. 39915 TOTAL 307.18 458.90 306.00 342.00 326.38 379.90 358.20 381.14
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 46.33 22.00 35.00 23.79 69.95 76.30 79.31
51. Part No. H7028 / Lawson No. 37546 TOTAL 80.00 92.66 44.00 70.00 47.58 139.90 152.60 158.62
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 50.00 176.33 150.00 169.00 158.94 129.95 151.95 172.21
52. Part No. H7032 / Lawson No. 37550 TOTAL 100.00 352.66 300.00 338.00 317.88 259.90 303.90 344.42
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN TRANSFER ROLLER PRICE 10.00 28.33 20.00 49.00 124.26 149.95 160.00 NO BID
53. Part No. M7077 / Lawson No. 40118 TOTAL 20.00 56.66 40.00 98.00 248.52 299.90 320.00
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 199.95 218.50 227.64
54, Part No. H7029 / Lawson No. 37547 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 399.90 437.00 455,28
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 199.95 218.50 227.64
55. Part No. H7031 / Lawson No. 37548 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 399.90 437.00 455.28
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 199.95 218.50 227.64
56. Part No. H7030 / Lawson No. 37549 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 399.90 437.00 455,28
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 168.33 160.00 175.00 169.15 199.95 190.00 208.20
57. Part No. KX491 / Lawson No. 37538 TOTAL 100.00 336.66 320.00 350.00 338.30 399.90 380.00 416.40
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 76.33 29.00 49.00 30.59 82.95 76.20 83.38
58. Part No. KD580 / Lawson No. 37534 TOTAL 400.00 763.30 290.00 490.00 305.90 829.50 762.00 833.80
5 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 135.00 210.00 149.00 169.00 158.94 179.95 175.00 185.62
59. Part No. NF792 / Part No. 38103 TOTAL 675.00 1,050.00 745.00 845.00 794.70 899.75 875.00 928.10
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 98.88 100.00 49.00 107.09 199.95 199.65 219.37
60. Part No. JD762 / Lawson No. 37535 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 400.00 196.00 428.36 799.80 798.60 877.48
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 199.95 199.65 219.37
61. Part No. JD761 / Lawson No. 37536 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 799.80 798.60 877.48 B m
4ea. UNIT e >
DELL 5110CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 199.95 199.65 219.37 5' 2
62. Part No. GD918 / Lawson No. 37537 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 799.80 798.60 877.48 2 Q
2 ea. UNIT =0
DELL 5130CDN BLACK P942P PRICE 120.00 133.88 110.00 115.00 116.44 129.95 127.95 135.98 5 ;
63. Part No. P942P / Lawson No. 41586 TOTAL 240.00 267.76 220.00 230.00 232.88 259.90 255.90 271.96 é %
2 ea. UNIT o
DELL 5130CDN CYAN G439R PRICE 160.00 133.88 156.00 160.00 165.74 179.95 181.90 193.54
64. Part No. G439R / Lawson No. 41589 TOTAL 320.00 267.76 312.00 320.00 331.48 359.90 363.80 387.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN IMAGNG DRUM G696R PRICE 80.00 98.00 72.00 89.00 76.49 86.95 84.20 89.32
65. Part No. G696R / Lawson No. 41590 TOTAL 160.00 196.00 144.00 178.00 152.98 173.90 168.40 178.64
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN MAGENTA H353R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 179.95 181.90 193.54
66. Part No. H353R / Lawson No. 41587 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 359.90 363.80 387.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN YELLOW D607R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 179.95 181.90 193.54
67. Part No. D607R / Lawson No. 41588 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 359.90 363.80 387.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5210N BLACK PRICE 185.00 138.88 223.00 210.00 237.14 259.95 264.80 276.93
68. Part No. UG219 / Lawson No. 37539 TOTAL 370.00 277.76 446.00 420.00 474.28 519.90 529.60 553.86
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 5230N BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 168.00 195.00 178.49 199.95 200.30 208.43
69. Part No. G310T / Lawson No. 37540 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,520.00 2,925.00 2,677.35 2,999.25 3,004.50 3,126.45
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN BLACK PRICE 199.00 198.88 200.00 228.00 165.74 233.95 233.15 248.13
70. Part No. 2CH2D / Lawson No. 37541 TOTAL 398.00 397.76 400.00 456.00 331.48 467.90 466.30 496.26
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN CYAN PRICE 270.00 288.88 287.00 331.00 305.99 339.95 335.20 357.32
71. Part No. YIJW24 / Lawson No. 37542 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 574.00 662.00 611.98 679.90 670.40 714.64
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 165.00 193.88 160.00 189.00 169.99 189.95 190.80 198.51
72. Part No. TM7KF / Lawson No. 37545 TOTAL 330.00 387.76 320.00 378.00 339.98 379.90 381.60 397.02
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN MAGENTA PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 339.95 335.20 357.32
73. Part No. 9H8X3 / Lawson No. 37543 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 679.90 670.40 714.64
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN YELLOW PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 339.95 335.20 357.32
74. Part No. 55GRP / Lawson No. 37544 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 679.90 670.40 714.64
2 ea. UNIT
DELL B3460DN BLACK PRICE 309.00 188.33 311.00 390.00 331.49 279.95 279.60 295.87
75. Part No. 1XCHF / Lawson No. 43198 TOTAL 618.00 376.66 622.00 780.00 662.98 559.90 559.20 591.74 B m
2 ea. UNIT e >
DELL C2660DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 109.00 136.00 115.58 129.95 127.00 134.28 5' 2
76. Part No. RD80W / Lawson No. 43199 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 218.00 272.00 231.16 259.90 254.00 268.56 2 Q
2 ea. UNIT =0
DELL C2660DN CYAN PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 132.95 131.65 138.89 5 ;
77. Part No. 488NH / Lawson No. 43201 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 265.90 263.30 277.78 é %
6 ea. UNIT o
DELL C2660DN MAGENTA PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 132.95 131.65 138.89
78. Part No. VXCWK / Lawson No. 43202 TOTAL 714.00 653.28 678.00 846.00 719.04 797.70 789.90 833.34
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN VOLT FUSER PRICE 25.00 268.33 120.00 165.00 127.49 149.95 143.25 148.88
79. Part No. PGT7T / Lawson No. 43203 TOTAL 50.00 536.66 240.00 330.00 254.98 299.90 286.50 297.76
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN YELLOW PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 132.95 131.65 138.89
80. Part No. YR3W3 / Lawson No. 43200 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 265.90 263.30 277.78
4 ea. UNIT
DELL B1260DN B1265DNF BLACK PRICE 70.00 68.88 66.00 83.00 70.54 82.95 77.70 82.38
81. Part No. RWXNT / Lawson No. 38740 TOTAL 280.00 275.52 264.00 332.00 282.16 331.80 310.80 329.52
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W BLACK PRICE 39.99 58.88 40.00 49.00 42.49 49.85 46.90 49.62
82. part NO. 7C6F7 / Lawson No. 43906 TOTAL 159.96 235.52 160.00 196.00 169.96 199.40 187.60 198.48
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W CYAN PRICE 44.79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 56.95 52.50 55.58
83. Part No. 5R6J0, Lawson No. 43907 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 227.80 210.00 222.32
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4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W MAGENTA PRICE 44,79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 56.95 52.50 55.58
84. Part No. 4J0X7 / Lawson No. 43908 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 227.80 210.00 222.32
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W YELLOW PRICE 44,79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 56.95 52.50 55.58
85. Part No. XY7N4 / Lawson No. 43909 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 227.80 210.00 222.32
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 2230d Toner PRICE 100.00 105.88 94.00 121.00 124,94 116.95 109.20 116.12
86. Part No. 3304131 / Lawson No. 45409 TOTAL 200.00 211.76 188.00 242.00 249.88 233.90 218.40 232.24
2 ea. UNIT
DELL Imaging Drum 1320C PRICE 50.00 98.33 88.00 89.00 84.99 99.95 93.50 99.24
87. Part No. KGR81 / Lawson No. 45637 TOTAL 100.00 196.66 176.00 178.00 169.98 199.90 187.00 198.48
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3319803 PRICE 75.00 83.33 72.00 84.00 76.49 89.95 84.20 89.32
86. Part No. 7MC5J / Lawson No. 45347 TOTAL 150.00 166.66 144.00 168.00 152.98 179.90 168.40 178.64
2 ea. UNIT
DELL B346DN PRICE 150.00 153.88 72.00 158.00 144.49 162.95 158.65 168.73
86. Part No. 3319805 / Lawson No. 44877 TOTAL 300.00 307.76 144.00 316.00 288.98 325.90 317.30 337.46 a
* L||_J g
<5
BASE TOTAL TOTAL 35,940.42 39,735.11 42,235.00 44,969.00 45,333.96 50,077.28 51,123.45 53,416.28 a %
Extension 1: June 1, 2019 - May 31, 2020 < (C,L)
15 ea. UNIT ,': 'ﬁ':J
DELL 1130 BLACK PRICE 75.99 55.00 76.00 84.00 80.74 90.85 91.46 99.25 % =
1. Part No. 7H53W / Lawson No. 37497 TOTAL 1,139.85 825.00 1,140.00 1,260.00 1,211.10 1,362.75 1,371.90 1,488.75 o %
2 ea. UNIT @
DELL 1230C BLACK PRICE 10.00 48.33 54.00 48.00 57.79 57.52 65.66 71.04
2. Part No. NO12K / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 20.00 96.66 108.00 96.00 115.58 115.04 131.32 142.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C CYAN PRICE 10.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 50.45 57.89 62.67
3. Part No. JO69K / Lawson No. 37499 TOTAL 20.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 100.90 115.78 125.34
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C IMAGING DRUM PRICE 80.00 79.99 88.00 103.00 93.49 111.05 105.99 114.93
4, Part No. K110K / Lawson No. 37502 TOTAL 160.00 159.98 176.00 206.00 186.98 222.10 211.98 229.86
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 50.45 57.89 62.67
5. Part No. J506K / Lawson No. 37500 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 100.90 115.78 125.34
2 ea/ UNIT
DELL 1230C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 42.88 45.00 48.00 50.99 50.45 57.89 62.67
6. Part No. M1276 / Lawson No. 37501 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 90.00 96.00 101.98 100.90 115.78 125.34
40 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C BLACK PRICE 59.24 48.33 63.00 70.00 67.14 70.65 76.17 82.53
7. Part No. KU052 / Lawson No. 37503 TOTAL 2,369.60 1,933.20 2,520.00 2,800.00 2,685.60 2,826.00 3,046.80 3,301.20
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10 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C CYAN PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 90.85 97.28 105.52
8. Part No. KU053 / Lawson No. 37504 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 908.50 972.80 1,055.20
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 90.85 97.28 105.52
9. Part No. KU055 / Lawson No. 37505 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 908.50 972.80 1,055.20
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 90.85 97.28 105.52
10. Part No. KU054 / Lawson No. 37506 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 908.50 972.80 1,055.20
25 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW BLACK PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 67.62 66.80 73.13
11. Part No. 3K9XM / Lawson No. 37507 TOTAL 1,487.25 1,347.00 1,400.00 1,625.00 1,487.25 1,690.50 1,670.00 1,828.25
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW CYAN PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13
12. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 37508 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,014.30 1,015.80 1,096.95
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13
13. Part No. 56DTC / Lawson No. 37509 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,014.30 1,015.80 1,096.95
20 ea. UNIT a
DELL 1350CNW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13 ,'-'_J g
14, Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 37510 TOTAL 1,189.80 1,077.60 1,120.00 1,300.00 1,189.80 1,352.40 1,354.40 1,462.60 i b
2 ea. UNIT 28
DELL 1700N BLACK PRICE 80.00 81.33 150.00 105.00 85.84 128.22 173.66 133.12 |<£ %
15. Part No. Y5009 / Lawson No. 37551 TOTAL 160.00 162.66 300.00 210.00 171.68 256.44 347.32 266.24 5 4
2 ea. UNIT Z %
DELL 1700N IMAGING DRUM PRICE 30.00 36.33 30.00 59.00 50.14 57.52 56.96 61.64 az
16. Part No. W5390 / Lawson No. 37552 TOTAL 60.00 72.66 60.00 118.00 100.28 115.04 113.92 123.28 @
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 BLACK PRICE 90.00 88.33 158.00 105.00 168.29 131.25 135.14 144.18
17. Part No. PY449 / Lawson No. 37511 TOTAL 180.00 176.66 316.00 210.00 336.58 262.50 270.28 288.36
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 IMAGING DRUM PRICE 20.00 36.33 46.00 59.00 49.29 40.35 56.08 60.59
18. Part No. MW685 / Lawson No. 37512 TOTAL 40.00 72.66 92.00 118.00 98.58 80.70 112.16 121.18
5 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW BLACK PRICE 55.99 53.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 67.62 66.80 73.13
19. Part No. DCONW / Lawson No. 40012 TOTAL 279.95 269.40 280.00 320.00 297.45 338.10 334.00 365.65
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW CYAN PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13
20. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 40015 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 270.48 270.88 292.52
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13
21. Part No. 4ADV2W / Lawson No. 40014 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 270.48 270.88 292.52
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 67.62 67.72 73.13
22. Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 40013 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 270.48 270.88 292.52

8
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15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN BLACK PRICE 82.39 76.33 82.00 85.00 87.54 97.92 99.14 107.60
23. Part No. MY5TJ / Lawson No. 37513 TOTAL 1,235.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,275.00 1,313.10 1,468.80 1,487.10 1,614.00
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN CYAN PRICE 81.59 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 97.92 98.26 106.56
24, Part No. THKJ8 / Lawson No. 37514 TOTAL 1,223.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,468.80 1,473.90 1,598.40
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 79.99 98.88 80.00 92.00 84.99 100.95 96.31 104.46
25. Part No. WDH78 / Lawson No. 37517 TOTAL 159.98 197.76 160.00 184.00 169.98 201.90 192.62 208.92
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN MAGENTA PRICE 79.99 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 97.92 98.26 106.56
26. Part No. 2Y3CM / Lawson No. 37515 TOTAL 1,199.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,468.80 1,473.90 1,598.40
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN YELLOW PRICE 79.99 76.33 81.00 92.00 86.69 97.92 98.26 106.56
27. Part No. 9X54J / Lawson No. 37516 TOTAL 799.90 763.30 810.00 920.00 866.90 979.20 982.60 1,065.60
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2330DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 121.15 158.57 172.39 A
28. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37518 TOTAL 1,500.00 1,303.20 1,980.00 1,875.00 2,103.60 1,817.25 2,378.55 2,585.85 Wy
>
10 ea. UNIT 5 =
DELL 2350DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 121.15 158.57 172.39 é) %
29. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37519 TOTAL 1,000.00 868.80 1,320.00 1,250.00 1,402.40 1,211.50 1,585.70 1,723.90 <5
15 ea. UNIT ',: Iﬁ':J
DELL 2360DN BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 184.00 160.00 195.49 164.58 163.41 177.61 % =
30. Part No. 1V7V7 / Lawson No. 41609 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,760.00 2,400.00 2,932.35 2,468.70 2,451.15 2,664.15 a %
2 ea. UNIT m
DELL 3010CN BLACK PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 60.55 62.83 67.61
31. Part No. KH225 / Lawson No. 37520 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 121.10 125.66 135.22
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN CYAN PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 86.81 91.98 99.25
32. Part No. TH207 / Lawson No. 37521 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 173.62 183.96 198.50
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 4.00 201.05 160.00 99.00 170.84 100.95 192.87 210.00
33. Part No. M5065 / Lawson No. 37524 TOTAL 8.00 402.10 320.00 198.00 341.68 201.90 385.74 420.00
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN MAGENTA PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 86.81 91.98 99.25
34. Part No. TH209 / Lawson No. 37522 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 173.62 183.96 198.50
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN YELLOW PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 86.81 91.98 99.25
35. Part No. TH208 / Lawson No. 37523 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 173.62 183.96 198.50
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 216.33 184.00 221.00 194.65 222.15 225.26 239.26
36. Part No. XG715 / Lawson No. 37529 TOTAL 100.00 432.66 368.00 442.00 389.30 444.30 450.52 478.52




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

18-1202

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM S S 2
P. O. BOX 2449 o £ g . o &
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - S 33 g g g = & 1 . o MY
o =3 5 S g =) © S 0 B ) © > S I 2 ®
TABULATION OF BIDS 5 E 583 o= 2 3 S8 & >R £ g &z 050' -g,o ~
S o =< g £ 5 e X B X s © S = g Q X
prorosaL  Annual Contract for Dell Printer Ink Toners, Cartridges s 2 B O I 8 s 8 S =3 = o - & o < s 8 E § =
. o z < > c - S Hh - S ow© g e (ST S & v o O
FOR: and Other Supplies g N g S &3 o S E 22 s Sag s £ s I = o ug S Bz
TIME &, (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019) £ 358 o283 S5 8 S &3S SIS w2 58 S ui S = 3L
i oo = - 8>> E > 2 = © > Ewd S N ~m 9 cE~ 5 o S
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 24, 2018 o 23N T 6o £29 5 gQN< 3a = P Sa 2 e
n I -
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY _IE [l 3 8 E g U_) E 8 6 3 2 L% 8 ?\rl (7) % > :r' 8 IE o § ﬁ S! 8 ; [} $
2ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 116.00 139.00 130.89 141.35 150.79 160.88
37. Part No. XG721 / Lawson No. 37525 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 232.00 278.00 261.78 282.70 301.58 321.76
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN CYAN PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 131.25 138.43 150.44
38. Part No. XG726 / Lawson No. 37526 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244.78 262.50 276.86 300.88
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN MAGENTA PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 131.25 138.43 150.44
39. Part No. XG727 / Lawson No. 37527 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244.78 262.50 276.86 300.88
2ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN YELLOW PRICE 115.00 98.88 116.00 135.00 122.39 131.25 138.43 150.44
40. Part No. XG728 / Lawson No. 37528 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 232.00 270.00 244.78 262.50 276.86 300.88
6 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN BLACK PRICE 118.00 106.88 112.00 120.00 118.99 131.25 134.67 145.38
41. Part No. G486F / Lawson No. 37530 TOTAL 708.00 641.28 672.00 720.00 713.94 787.50 808.02 872.28
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN CYAN PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 97.92 101.10 109.69 A
42. Part No. G479F / Lawson No. 37531 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 195.84 202.20 219.38 0w
>
2 ea. UNIT < =
DELL 3130CN MAGENTA PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 97.92 101.10 109.69 5' %
43. Part No. G480F / Lawson No. 37532 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 195.84 202.20 219.38 2 %4
2ea. UNIT '; |
DELL 3130CN YELLOW PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 97.92 101.10 109.69 @) g
44. Part No. G481F / Lawson No. 37533 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 195.84 202.20 219.38 g o
2 ea. UNIT m Z
DELL 3330DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 143.33 127.00 158.00 135.99 151.45 153.83 167.16
45. Part No. U902R / Part No. 38741 TOTAL 238.00 286.66 254.00 316.00 271.98 302.90 307.66 334.32
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3333DN 3335DN BLACK PRICE 179.00 126.33 172.00 199.00 182.74 209.02 206.52 NO BID
46. Part No. HMHWS3 / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 358.00 252.66 344.00 398.00 365.48 418.04 413.04
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN BLACK PRICE 107.99 106.88 108.00 125.00 114.74 131.25 129.78 141.04
47. Part No. 4CHT7 / Lawson No. 39913 TOTAL 215.98 213.76 216.00 250.00 229.48 262.50 259.56 282.08
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN CYAN PRICE 153.59 143.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 191.85 184.47 200.60
48. Part No. 9FY32 / Lawson No. 39914 TOTAL 307.18 286.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 383.70 368.94 401.20
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN MAGENTA PRICE 153.59 148.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 191.85 184.47 200.60
49. Part No. H5XJP / Lawson No. 39916 TOTAL 307.18 296.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 383.70 368.94 401.20
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN YELLOW PRICE 153.59 229.45 153.00 171.00 163.19 191.85 184.47 200.60
50. Part No. RGJCW / Lawson No. 39915 TOTAL 307.18 458.90 306.00 342.00 326.38 383.70 368.94 401.20
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 46.33 22.00 35.00 23.79 70.65 78.59 83.48
51. Part No. H7028 / Lawson No. 37546 TOTAL 80.00 92.66 44.00 70.00 47.58 141.30 157.18 166.96
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 50.00 176.33 150.00 169.00 158.94 131.25 156.51 181.27
52. Part No. H7032 / Lawson No. 37550 TOTAL 100.00 352.66 300.00 338.00 317.88 262.50 313.02 362.54
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN TRANSFER ROLLER PRICE 10.00 28.33 20.00 49.00 124.26 151.45 164.80 NO BID
53. Part No. M7077 / Lawson No. 40118 TOTAL 20.00 56.66 40.00 98.00 248.52 302.90 329.60
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 201.95 225.06 239.62
54, Part No. H7029 / Lawson No. 37547 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 403.90 450.12 479.24
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 201.95 225.06 239.62
55. Part No. H7031 / Lawson No. 37548 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 403.90 450.12 479.24
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 201.95 225.06 239.62 o
56. Part No. H7030 / Lawson No. 37549 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 403.90 450.12 479.24 ,'-'_J g
2 ea. UNIT < =
)]
DELL 5110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 168.33 160.00 175.00 169.15 201.95 195.70 219.16 8 %
57. Part No. KX491 / Lawson No. 37538 TOTAL 100.00 336.66 320.00 350.00 338.30 403.90 391.40 438.32 ,i: o
10 ea. UNIT — g
DELL 5110CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 76.33 29.00 49.00 30.59 83.78 78.49 87.77 % =
58. Part No. KD580 / Lawson No. 37534 TOTAL 400.00 763.30 290.00 490.00 305.90 837.80 784.90 877.70 a g
5 ea. UNIT 0
DELL 5110CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 135.00 210.00 149.00 169.00 158.94 181.75 180.25 195.39
59. Part No. NF792 / Part No. 38103 TOTAL 675.00 1,050.00 745.00 845.00 794.70 908.75 901.25 976.95
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 98.88 100.00 49.00 107.09 201.95 205.64 230.92
60. Part No. JD762 / Lawson No. 37535 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 400.00 196.00 428.36 807.80 822.56 923.68
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 201.95 205.64 230.92
61. Part No. JD761 / Lawson No. 37536 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 807.80 822.56 923.68
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 201.95 205.64 230.92
62. Part No. GD918 / Lawson No. 37537 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 807.80 822.56 923.68
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN BLACK P942p PRICE 120.00 133.88 110.00 115.00 116.44 131.25 131.79 143.14
63. Part No. P942P / Lawson No. 41586 TOTAL 240.00 267.76 220.00 230.00 232.88 262.50 263.58 286.28
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN CYAN G439R PRICE 160.00 133.88 156.00 160.00 165.74 181.75 187.36 203.73
64. Part No. G439R / Lawson No. 41589 TOTAL 320.00 267.76 312.00 320.00 331.48 363.50 374.72 407.46
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN IMAGNG DRUM G696R PRICE 80.00 98.00 72.00 89.00 76.49 87.82 86.73 94.02
65. Part No. G696R / Lawson No. 41590 TOTAL 160.00 196.00 144.00 178.00 152.98 175.64 173.46 188.04
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN MAGENTA H353R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 181.75 187.36 203.73
66. Part No. H353R / Lawson No. 41587 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 363.50 374.72 407.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN YELLOW D607R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 181.75 187.36 203.73
67. Part No. D607R / Lawson No. 41588 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 363.50 374.72 407.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5210N BLACK PRICE 185.00 138.88 223.00 210.00 237.14 262.55 272.74 291.51
68. Part No. UG219 / Lawson No. 37539 TOTAL 370.00 277.76 446.00 420.00 474.28 525.10 545.48 583.02
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 5230N BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 168.00 195.00 178.49 201.95 206.31 219.40
69. Part No. G310T / Lawson No. 37540 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,520.00 2,925.00 2,677.35 3,029.25 3,094.65 3,291.00
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN BLACK PRICE 199.00 198.88 200.00 228.00 165.74 236.29 240.14 261.19
70. Part No. 2CH2D / Lawson No. 37541 TOTAL 398.00 397.76 400.00 456.00 331.48 472.58 480.28 522.38 B m
2 ea. UNIT e >
DELL 7130CDN CYAN PRICE 270.00 288.88 287.00 331.00 305.99 343.35 245.26 376.13 5' 2
71. Part No. YJW24 / Lawson No. 37542 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 574.00 662.00 611.98 686.70 490.52 752.26 2 Q
2 ea. UNIT =0
DELL 7130CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 165.00 193.88 160.00 189.00 169.99 191.85 196.52 208.96 5 ;
72. Part No. TM7KF / Lawson No. 37545 TOTAL 330.00 387.76 320.00 378.00 339.98 383.70 393.04 417.92 é e
2 ea. UNIT o <
DELL 7130CDN MAGENTA PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 343.35 345.26 376.13
73. Part No. 9H8X3 / Lawson No. 37543 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 686.70 690.52 752.26
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN YELLOW PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 343.35 345.26 376.13
74. Part No. 55GRP / Lawson No. 37544 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 686.70 690.52 752.26
2 ea. UNIT
DELL B3460DN BLACK PRICE 309.00 188.33 311.00 390.00 331.49 282.75 287.99 311.44
75. Part No. 1XCHF / Lawson No. 43198 TOTAL 618.00 376.66 622.00 780.00 662.98 565.50 575.98 622.88
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 109.00 136.00 115.58 131.25 130.81 141.35
76. Part No. RD80W / Lawson No. 43199 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 218.00 272.00 231.16 262.50 261.62 282.70
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN CYAN PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 134.28 135.60 146.20
77. Part No. 488NH / Lawson No. 43201 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 268.56 271.20 292.40
6 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN MAGENTA PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 134.28 135.60 146.20
78. Part No. VXCWK / Lawson No. 43202 TOTAL 714.00 653.28 678.00 846.00 719.04 805.68 813.60 877.20
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN VOLT FUSER PRICE 25.00 268.33 120.00 165.00 127.49 151.45 147.55 156.72
79. Part No. PGT7T / Lawson No. 43203 TOTAL 50.00 536.66 240.00 330.00 254.98 302.90 295.10 313.44
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN YELLOW PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 134.28 135.60 146.20
80. Part No. YR3W3 / Lawson No. 43200 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 268.56 271.20 292.40
4 ea. UNIT
DELL B1260DN B1265DNF BLACK PRICE 70.00 68.88 66.00 83.00 70.54 83.78 80.03 86.72
81. Part No. RWXNT / Lawson No. 38740 TOTAL 280.00 275.52 264.00 332.00 282.16 335.12 320.12 346.88
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W BLACK PRICE 39.99 58.88 40.00 49.00 42.49 50.45 48.31 52.23
82. part NO. 7C6F7 / Lawson No. 43906 TOTAL 159.96 235.52 160.00 196.00 169.96 201.80 193.24 208.92
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W CYAN PRICE 44.79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 57.52 54.08 58.51
83. Part No. 5R6J0, Lawson No. 43907 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 230.08 216.32 234.04
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W MAGENTA PRICE 44,79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 57.52 54.08 58.51
84. Part No. 4J0X7 / Lawson No. 43908 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 230.08 216.32 234.04 a
4 ea. UNIT L w
DELL 1660W YELLOW PRICE 44.79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 57.52 54.08 58.51 f 5
85. Part No. XY7N4 / Lawson No. 43909 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 230.08 216.32 234.04 a %
2 ea. UNIT ,i: %
DELL 2230d Toner PRICE 100.00 105.88 94.00 121.00 124.94 118.12 112.48 122.23 — ﬁ
86. Part No. 3304131 / Lawson No. 45409 TOTAL 200.00 211.76 188.00 242.00 249.88 236.24 224.96 244.46 Cz) z
2 ea. UNIT a) %
DELL Imaging Drum 1320C PRICE 50.00 98.33 88.00 89.00 84.99 100.95 96.31 104.46 o
87. Part No. KGR81 / Lawson No. 45637 TOTAL 100.00 196.66 176.00 178.00 169.98 201.90 192.62 208.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3319803 PRICE 75.00 83.33 72.00 84.00 76.49 90.85 86.73 94.02
86. Part No. 7MC5J / Lawson No. 45347 TOTAL 150.00 166.66 144.00 168.00 152.98 181.70 173.46 188.04
2 ea. UNIT
DELL B346DN PRICE 150.00 153.88 72.00 158.00 144.49 164.58 163.41 177.61
86. Part No. 3319805 / Lawson No. 44877 TOTAL 300.00 307.76 144.00 316.00 288.98 329.16 326.82 355.22
EXTENSION 1 TOTAL TOTAL 35,940.42 39,735.11 42,235.00 44,969.00 45,333.96 50,584.16 52,457.72 56,228.42
Extension 2: June 1, 2020 - May 31, 2021
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1130 BLACK PRICE 75.99 55.00 76.00 84.00 80.74 91.76 95.12 104.47
1. Part No. 7H53W / Lawson No. 37497 TOTAL 1,139.85 825.00 1,140.00 1,260.00 1,211.10 1,376.40 1,426.80 1,567.05
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C BLACK PRICE 10.00 48.33 54.00 48.00 57.79 58.09 68.29 74.78
2. Part No. NO12K / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 20.00 96.66 108.00 96.00 115.58 116.18 136.58 149.56
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C CYAN PRICE 10.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 50.95 60.21 65.97
3. Part No. JO69K / Lawson No. 37499 TOTAL 20.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 101.90 120.42 131.94
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C IMAGING DRUM PRICE 80.00 79.99 88.00 103.00 93.49 112.16 110.23 120.98
4, Part No. K110K / Lawson No. 37502 TOTAL 160.00 159.98 176.00 206.00 186.98 224.32 220.46 241.96
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1230C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 42.88 48.00 48.00 50.99 50.95 60.21 65.97
5. Part No. J506K / Lawson No. 37500 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 96.00 96.00 101.98 101.90 120.42 131.94
2 eal UNIT
DELL 1230C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 42.88 45.00 48.00 50.99 50.95 60.21 65.97
6. Part No. M1276 / Lawson No. 37501 TOTAL 80.00 85.76 90.00 96.00 101.98 101.90 120.42 131.94
40 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C BLACK PRICE 59.24 48.33 63.00 70.00 67.14 71.36 79.22 86.87
7. Part No. KU052 / Lawson No. 37503 TOTAL 2,369.60 1,933.20 2,520.00 2,800.00 2,685.60 2,854.40 3,168.80 3,474.80
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 1320C CYAN PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 91.76 101.17 111.07
8. Part No. KU053 / Lawson No. 37504 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 917.60 1,011.70 1,110.70 8 w
10 ea. UNIT >
DELL 1320C MAGENTA PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 91.76 101.17 111.07 5' 2
9. Part No. KU055 / Lawson No. 37505 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 917.60 1,011.70 1,110.70 2 8
10 ea. UNIT = 0
DELL 1320C YELLOW PRICE 40.00 68.33 80.00 74.00 85.84 91.76 101.17 111.07 'c_) ;
10. Part No. KU054 / Lawson No. 37506 TOTAL 400.00 683.30 800.00 740.00 858.40 917.60 1,011.70 1,110.70 g g
25 ea. UNIT o
DELL 1350CNW BLACK PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 68.30 69.47 76.98
11. Part No. 3K9XM / Lawson No. 37507 TOTAL 1,487.25 1,347.00 1,400.00 1,625.00 1,487.25 1,707.50 1,736.75 1,924.50
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW CYAN PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
12. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 37508 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,024.50 1,056.45 1,154.70
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
13. Part No. 56 DTC / Lawson No. 37509 TOTAL 892.35 808.20 840.00 975.00 892.35 1,024.50 1,056.45 1,154.70
20 ea. UNIT
DELL 1350CNW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 53.88 56.00 65.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
14, Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 37510 TOTAL 1,189.80 1,077.60 1,120.00 1,300.00 1,189.80 1,366.00 1,408.60 1,539.60
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1700N BLACK PRICE 80.00 81.33 150.00 105.00 85.84 129.50 180.61 140.13
15. Part No. Y5009 / Lawson No. 37551 TOTAL 160.00 162.66 300.00 210.00 171.68 259.00 361.22 280.26
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1700N IMAGING DRUM PRICE 30.00 36.33 30.00 59.00 50.14 58.09 59.24 64.88
16. Part No. W5390 / Lawson No. 37552 TOTAL 60.00 72.66 60.00 118.00 100.28 116.18 118.48 129.76
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 BLACK PRICE 90.00 88.33 158.00 105.00 168.29 132.56 140.55 151.77
17. Part No. PY449 / Lawson No. 37511 TOTAL 180.00 176.66 316.00 210.00 336.58 265.12 281.10 303.54
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 1720 IMAGING DRUM PRICE 20.00 36.33 46.00 59.00 49.29 40.75 58.32 63.78
18. Part No. MW685 / Lawson No. 37512 TOTAL 40.00 72.66 92.00 118.00 98.58 81.50 116.64 127.56
5 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW BLACK PRICE 55.99 53.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 68.30 69.40 76.98
19. Part No. DCONW / Lawson No. 40012 TOTAL 279.95 269.40 280.00 320.00 297.45 341.50 347.00 384.90
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW CYAN PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
20. Part No. 79K5P / Lawson No. 40015 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 273.20 281.72 307.92
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW MAGENTA PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
21. Part No. 4DV2W / Lawson No. 40014 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 273.20 281.72 307.92
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1760NW YELLOW PRICE 59.49 56.88 56.00 64.00 59.49 68.30 70.43 76.98
22. Part No. W8X8P / Lawson No. 40013 TOTAL 237.96 227.52 224.00 256.00 237.96 273.20 281.72 307.92 B "
15 ea. UNIT :: >
DELL 2150CDN BLACK PRICE 82.39 76.33 82.00 85.00 87.54 98.90 103.11 113.26 5' 2
23. Part No. MY5TJ / Lawson No. 37513 TOTAL 1,235.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,275.00 1,313.10 1,483.50 1,546.65 1,698.90 2 Q
15 ea. UNIT D
DELL 2150CDN CYAN PRICE 81.59 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 98.90 102.19 112.17 ('3 o
24, Part No. THKJ8 / Lawson No. 37514 TOTAL 1,223.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,483.50 1,532.85 1,682.55 é %
2 ea. UNIT o <
DELL 2150CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 79.99 98.88 80.00 92.00 84.99 101.96 100.16 109.96
25. Part No. WDH78 / Lawson No. 37517 TOTAL 159.98 197.76 160.00 184.00 169.98 203.92 200.32 219.92
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN MAGENTA PRICE 79.99 76.33 82.00 92.00 86.69 98.90 102.19 112.17
26. Part No. 2Y3CM / Lawson No. 37515 TOTAL 1,199.85 1,144.95 1,230.00 1,380.00 1,300.35 1,483.50 1,532.85 1,682.55
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 2150CDN YELLOW PRICE 79.99 76.33 81.00 92.00 86.69 98.90 102.19 112.17
27. Part No. 9X54J / Lawson No. 37516 TOTAL 799.90 763.30 810.00 920.00 866.90 989.00 1,021.90 1,121.70
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2330DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 122.36 164.91 181.46
28. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37518 TOTAL 1,500.00 1,303.20 1,980.00 1,875.00 2,103.60 1,835.40 2,473.65 2,721.90
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 2350DN BLACK PRICE 100.00 86.88 132.00 125.00 140.24 122.36 164.91 181.46
29. Part No. DM253 / Lawson No. 37519 TOTAL 1,000.00 868.80 1,320.00 1,250.00 1,402.40 1,223.60 1,649.10 1,814.60
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 2360DN BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 184.00 160.00 195.49 166.23 169.95 186.96
30. Part No. 1V7V7 / Lawson No. 41609 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,760.00 2,400.00 2,932.35 2,493.45 2,549.25 2,804.40
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN BLACK PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 61.15 65.34 71.17
31. Part No. KH225 / Lawson No. 37520 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 122.30 130.68 142.34
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN CYAN PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 87.68 95.66 104.47
32. Part No. TH207 / Lawson No. 37521 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 175.36 191.32 208.94
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 4.00 201.05 160.00 99.00 170.84 101.96 200.58 221.05
33. Part No. M5065 / Lawson No. 37524 TOTAL 8.00 402.10 320.00 198.00 341.68 203.92 401.16 442.10
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN MAGENTA PRICE 4.00 48.33 20.00 39.00 80.00 87.68 95.66 104.47
34. Part No. TH209 / Lawson No. 37522 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 40.00 78.00 160.00 175.36 191.32 208.94
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3010CN YELLOW PRICE 4.00 48.33 76.00 39.00 80.00 87.68 95.66 104.47
35. Part No. TH208 / Lawson No. 37523 TOTAL 8.00 96.66 152.00 78.00 160.00 175.36 191.32 208.94
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 216.33 184.00 221.00 194.65 224.87 234.27 251.85 A
36. Part No. XG715 / Lawson No. 37529 TOTAL 100.00 432.66 368.00 442.00 389.30 449.74 468.54 503.70 L ._.>J
2 ea. UNIT < =
DELL 3110CN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 116.00 139.00 130.89 142.76 156.82 169.35 5' (£
37. Part No. XG721 / Lawson No. 37525 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 232.00 278.00 261.78 285.52 313.64 338.70 ?,% 8
2 ea. UNIT '; o
DELL 3110CN CYAN PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 132.56 143.97 158.36 (@] DZ':
38. Part No. XG726 / Lawson No. 37526 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244.78 265.12 287.94 316.72 é %
2 ea. UNIT o
DELL 3110CN MAGENTA PRICE 115.00 98.88 115.00 135.00 122.39 132.56 143.97 158.36
39. Part No. XG727 / Lawson No. 37527 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 230.00 270.00 244,78 265.12 287.94 316.72
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3110CN YELLOW PRICE 115.00 98.88 116.00 135.00 122.39 132.56 143.97 158.36
40. Part No. XG728 / Lawson No. 37528 TOTAL 230.00 197.76 232.00 270.00 244,78 265.12 287.94 316.72
6 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN BLACK PRICE 118.00 106.88 112.00 120.00 118.99 132.56 140.06 153.03
41. Part No. G486F / Lawson No. 37530 TOTAL 708.00 641.28 672.00 720.00 713.94 795.36 840.36 918.18
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN CYAN PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 98.90 105.14 115.46
42. Part No. G479F / Lawson No. 37531 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 197.80 210.28 230.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN MAGENTA PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 98.90 105.14 115.46
43. Part No. G480F / Lawson No. 37532 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 197.80 210.28 230.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3130CN YELLOW PRICE 90.00 93.88 84.00 94.00 89.24 98.90 105.14 115.46
44, Part No. G481F / Lawson No. 37533 TOTAL 180.00 187.76 168.00 188.00 178.48 197.80 210.28 230.92
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3330DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 143.33 127.00 158.00 135.99 152.96 159.98 175.96
45, Part No. U902R / Part No. 38741 TOTAL 238.00 286.66 254.00 316.00 271.98 305.92 319.96 351.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3333DN 3335DN BLACK PRICE 179.00 126.33 172.00 199.00 182.74 211.11 214.78 NO BID
46. Part No. HMHW3 / Lawson No. 39624 TOTAL 358.00 252.66 344.00 398.00 365.48 422.22 429.56
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN BLACK PRICE 107.99 106.88 108.00 125.00 114.74 132.56 134.97 148.46
47. Part No. 4CHT7 / Lawson No. 39913 TOTAL 215.98 213.76 216.00 250.00 229.48 265.12 269.94 296.92
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN CYAN PRICE 153.59 143.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 193.77 191.85 211.16
48. Part No. 9FY32 / Lawson No. 39914 TOTAL 307.18 286.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 387.54 383.70 422.32
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN MAGENTA PRICE 153.59 148.33 154.00 171.00 163.19 193.77 191.85 211.16
49, Part No. H5XJP / Lawson No. 39916 TOTAL 307.18 296.66 308.00 342.00 326.38 387.54 383.70 422.32
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 3760DN YELLOW PRICE 153.59 229.45 153.00 171.00 163.19 193.77 191.85 211.16
50. Part No. RGJCW / Lawson No. 39915 TOTAL 307.18 458.90 306.00 342.00 326.38 387.54 383.70 422.32 8 "
2 ea. UNIT |<7: >
DELL 5100CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 46.33 22.00 35.00 23.79 71.36 81.73 87.87 5' 2
51. Part No. H7028 / Lawson No. 37546 TOTAL 80.00 92.66 44.00 70.00 47.58 142.72 163.46 175.74 2 g_J
2 ea. UNIT = D
DELL 5100CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 50.00 176.33 150.00 169.00 158.94 132.56 162.77 190.81 5 x
52. Part No. H7032 / Lawson No. 37550 TOTAL 100.00 352.66 300.00 338.00 317.88 265.12 325.54 381.62 g %
2 ea. UNIT o <
DELL 5100CN TRANSFER ROLLER PRICE 10.00 28.33 20.00 49.00 124.26 152.96 171.39 NO BID
53. Part No. M7077 / Lawson No. 40118 TOTAL 20.00 56.66 40.00 98.00 248.52 305.92 342.78
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 203.97 234.06 252.23
54, Part No. H7029 / Lawson No. 37547 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 407.94 468.12 504.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 203.97 234.06 252.23
55. Part No. H7031 / Lawson No. 37548 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 407.94 468.12 504.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5100CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 78.33 96.00 49.00 101.99 203.97 234.06 252.23
56. Part No. H7030 / Lawson No. 37549 TOTAL 20.00 156.66 192.00 98.00 203.98 407.94 468.12 504.46
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN 110V FUSER KIT PRICE 50.00 168.33 160.00 175.00 169.15 203.97 203.53 230.69
57. Part No. KX491 / Lawson No. 37538 TOTAL 100.00 336.66 320.00 350.00 338.30 407.94 407.06 461.38
10 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN BLACK PRICE 40.00 76.33 29.00 49.00 30.59 84.62 81.63 92.39
58. Part No. KD580 / Lawson No. 37534 TOTAL 400.00 763.30 290.00 490.00 305.90 846.20 816.30 923.90
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5 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 135.00 210.00 149.00 169.00 158.94 183.57 187.46 205.67
59. Part No. NF792 / Part No. 38103 TOTAL 675.00 1,050.00 745.00 845.00 794.70 917.85 937.30 1,028.35
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN CYAN PRICE 10.00 98.88 100.00 49.00 107.09 203.97 213.87 243.07
60. Part No. JD762 / Lawson No. 37535 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 400.00 196.00 428.36 815.88 855.48 972.28
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN MAGENTA PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 203.97 213.87 243.07
61. Part No. JD761 / Lawson No. 37536 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 815.88 855.48 972.28
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 5110CN YELLOW PRICE 10.00 98.88 101.00 49.00 107.09 203.97 213.87 243.07
62. Part No. GD918 / Lawson No. 37537 TOTAL 40.00 395.52 404.00 196.00 428.36 815.88 855.48 972.28
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN BLACK P942P PRICE 120.00 133.88 110.00 115.00 116.44 132.56 137.06 150.67
63. Part No. P942P / Lawson No. 41586 TOTAL 240.00 267.76 220.00 230.00 232.88 265.12 274.12 301.34
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5130CDN CYAN G439R PRICE 160.00 133.88 156.00 160.00 165.74 183.57 194.85 214.45
64. Part No. G439R / Lawson No. 41589 TOTAL 320.00 267.76 312.00 320.00 331.48 367.14 389.70 428.90 B m
2 ea. UNIT e >
DELL 5130CDN IMAGNG DRUM G696R PRICE 80.00 98.00 72.00 89.00 76.49 88.70 90.20 98.97 5' 2
65. Part No. G696R / Lawson No. 41590 TOTAL 160.00 196.00 144.00 178.00 152.98 177.40 180.40 197.94 2 Q
2 ea. UNIT =0
DELL 5130CDN MAGENTA H353R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 183.57 194.85 214.45 5 ;
66. Part No. H353R / Lawson No. 41587 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 367.14 389.70 428.90 é %
2 ea. UNIT o
DELL 5130CDN YELLOW D607R PRICE 160.00 188.00 156.00 160.00 165.74 183.57 194.85 214.45
67. Part No. D607R / Lawson No. 41588 TOTAL 320.00 376.00 312.00 320.00 331.48 367.14 389.70 428.90
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 5210N BLACK PRICE 185.00 138.88 223.00 210.00 237.14 265.17 283.65 306.85
68. Part No. UG219 / Lawson No. 37539 TOTAL 370.00 277.76 446.00 420.00 474.28 530.34 567.30 613.70
15 ea. UNIT
DELL 5230N BLACK PRICE 145.00 148.88 168.00 195.00 178.49 203.97 214.56 230.95
69. Part No. G310T / Lawson No. 37540 TOTAL 2,175.00 2,233.20 2,520.00 2,925.00 2,677.35 3,059.55 3,218.40 3,464.25
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN BLACK PRICE 199.00 198.88 200.00 228.00 165.74 238.68 249.75 274.94
70. Part No. 2CH2D / Lawson No. 37541 TOTAL 398.00 397.76 400.00 456.00 331.48 477.36 499.50 549.88
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN CYAN PRICE 270.00 288.88 287.00 331.00 305.99 346.78 359.07 395.93
71. Part No. YIJW24 / Lawson No. 37542 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 574.00 662.00 611.98 693.56 718.14 791.86
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN IMAGING DRUM PRICE 165.00 193.88 160.00 189.00 169.99 193.77 204.38 219.96
72. Part No. TM7KF / Lawson No. 37545 TOTAL 330.00 387.76 320.00 378.00 339.98 387.54 408.76 439.92
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN MAGENTA PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 346.78 359.07 395.93
73. Part No. 9H8X3 / Lawson No. 37543 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 693.56 718.14 791.86
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 7130CDN YELLOW PRICE 270.00 288.88 288.00 331.00 305.99 346.78 359.07 395.93
74. Part No. 55GRP / Lawson No. 37544 TOTAL 540.00 577.76 576.00 662.00 611.98 693.56 718.14 791.86
2 ea. UNIT
DELL B3460DN BLACK PRICE 309.00 188.33 311.00 390.00 331.49 285.58 299.51 327.83
75. Part No. 1XCHF / Lawson No. 43198 TOTAL 618.00 376.66 622.00 780.00 662.98 571.16 599.02 655.66
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN BLACK PRICE 119.00 98.88 109.00 136.00 115.58 132.56 136.04 148.79
76. Part No. RD80W / Lawson No. 43199 TOTAL 238.00 197.76 218.00 272.00 231.16 265.12 272.08 297.58
2 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN CYAN PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 135.62 141.02 153.89
77. Part No. 488NH / Lawson No. 43201 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 271.24 282.04 307.78
6 ea. UNIT
DELL C2660DN MAGENTA PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 135.62 141.02 153.89
78. Part No. VXCWK / Lawson No. 43202 TOTAL 714.00 653.28 678.00 846.00 719.04 813.72 846.12 923.34 B m
2 ea. UNIT e >
DELL C2660DN VOLT FUSER PRICE 25.00 268.33 120.00 165.00 127.49 152.96 153.45 164.97 5' 2
79. Part No. PGT7T / Lawson No. 43203 TOTAL 50.00 536.66 240.00 330.00 254.98 305.92 306.90 329.94 2 Q
2 ea. UNIT =0
DELL C2660DN YELLOW PRICE 119.00 108.88 113.00 141.00 119.84 135.62 141.02 153.89 5 ;
80. Part No. YR3W3 / Lawson No. 43200 TOTAL 238.00 217.76 226.00 282.00 239.68 271.24 282.04 307.78 é %
4 ea. UNIT o
DELL B1260DN B1265DNF BLACK PRICE 70.00 68.88 66.00 83.00 70.54 84.62 83.23 91.28
81. Part No. RWXNT / Lawson No. 38740 TOTAL 280.00 275.52 264.00 332.00 282.16 338.48 332.92 365.12
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W BLACK PRICE 39.99 58.88 40.00 49.00 42.49 50.95 50.24 54.98
82. part NO. 7C6F7 / Lawson No. 43906 TOTAL 159.96 235.52 160.00 196.00 169.96 203.80 200.96 219.92
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W CYAN PRICE 44.79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 58.09 56.24 61.59
83. Part No. 5R6J0, Lawson No. 43907 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 232.36 224.96 246.36
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W MAGENTA PRICE 44,79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 58.09 56.24 61.59
84. Part No. 4J0X7 / Lawson No. 43908 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 232.36 224.96 246.36
4 ea. UNIT
DELL 1660W YELLOW PRICE 44.79 58.88 45.00 56.00 47.59 58.09 56.24 61.59
85. Part No. XY7N4 / Lawson No. 43909 TOTAL 179.16 235.52 180.00 224.00 190.36 232.36 224.96 246.36
2 ea. UNIT
DELL 2230d Toner PRICE 100.00 105.88 94.00 121.00 124.94 119.30 116.98 128.66
86. Part No. 3304131 / Lawson No. 45409 TOTAL 200.00 211.76 188.00 242.00 249.88 238.60 233.96 257.32
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2 ea. UNIT
DELL Imaging Drum 1320C PRICE 50.00 98.33 88.00 89.00 84.99 101.96 100.16 109.96
87. Part No. KGR81 / Lawson No. 45637 TOTAL 100.00 196.66 176.00 178.00 169.98 203.92 200.32 219.92
2 ea. UNIT a
DELL 3319803 PRICE 75.00 83.33 72.00 84.00 76.49 91.76 90.20 98.97 H g
86. Part No. 7MC5J / Lawson No. 45347 TOTAL 150.00 166.66 144.00 168.00 152.98 183.52 180.40 197.94 <5
2 ea. UNIT 25
DELL B346DN PRICE 150.00 153.88 72.00 158.00 144.49 166.23 169.95 186.96 |<£ %
86. Part No. 3319805 / Lawson No. 44877 TOTAL 300.00 307.76 144.00 316.00 288.98 332.46 339.90 373.92 = B
* % (%
oz
EXTENSION 2 TOTAL TOTAL 35,940.42 39,735.11 42,235.00 44,969.00 45,333.96 51,091.51 54,763.76 59,187.47 @
*
GRAND TOTAL (BASE YEAR, EXT 1 & EXT 2) TOTAL 107,821.26 119,205.33 126,705.00 134,907.00 136,001.88 151,752.95 158,344.93 168,832.17
Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 2 days 3-4 days 3-5 days 7 days 7-10 days 2-3 days 5-7 days 2 days
* LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Abclaser USA Commonwealth Computer GovConnection Netsync Prime Systems Summus Industries
ARC Computer Solutions GS SHI Offic Max Prosperitus Solutions TanChes Global Mgmt
ark 111 Sys Connection GTS Office Pal Quantum Office Solutions Technologent
Beyond Technology Decision Tree Hied Office Supply Americal Quill TechQuarry
Cartridge World Dell Marketing Insight Public Sector OM Office Suppy SHI The Tree House
CDW Government EST Group JB Office PC Specialists Inc Sirius Computer Solutions V Quest
Centre Technololgies Express Computer Sys Laser Link Pivot Solutions Solutions Il Worlwide Imaging Supplies

Checkpoint Services
Coast to Coast Computer Products

GCS Technologies
General Datatech

Logical Front, LLC
M&S Technologies

20

Premier Logitech
Presidio Networked Solutions

Spectrum Imaging
Sterling Computers

Demandstar
SAWS Website



